
EIWTC School Year (2016-17) 

Course Descriptions  

 

APOSTLE THOMPSON’S CLASS –  

(Book/Course to be determined by Apostle Thompson) -*1st and 2nd Year course 

 

First Year Courses: 

Alliance of Honorable Men (Dr. Leroy Thompson, Jr.) 

"The Alliance of Honorable Men" is a book destined to INSPIRE A PEOPLE MOVEMENT! This move of the Holy 

Spirit will consolidate the church, refresh the workforce and strengthen the mandate of the leadership. These 

life-changing principles are laden with the synergistic force to propel the Church to finish her God-given 

assignment on the earth. We can destroy the strategy of Satan to divide and conquer by being covenanted 

together as partners in destiny. We can enhance the 'strength of ten thousands' to finish God's will and 

purposes for our generation. "The Alliance of Honorable Men" is the key to a healthy growing church. It is the 

alternative to the collapsing society of men. "The Alliance of Honorable Men" will position your church to live 

according to John 17 and fulfill the prayer of Jesus. 

Living By The Book (Dr. D. M. Thompson) 

For every person who draws strength and direction from the Bible, there are many more who struggle with 
it. Some call it a long book with fine print and obscure meaning. Some call it a mystery. A chore to read. An 
undecipherable puzzle. The good news is you can easily solve this problem. In a simple, step-by-step fashion, 
the authors explain how to glean truth from Scripture. It is practical, readable, and applicable. By following its 
easy-to-apply principles, you'll soon find yourself drawing great nourishment from the Word--and enjoying the 
process!  

Moving in the Gifts of Revelation & Prophecy (Dr. W. Ron Walker) *1st Semester 

The Gifts of the Holy Spirit empowers believers to function as effective vessels demonstrating the relevance of 

the Gospel today. This book lays clear apostolic foundation for the release of all the vocal and revelation gifts 

paving the way for the breaking forth of the power gifts. This excellent workable strategy allows the believer 

to understand how to move in simple prophecy and also how to develop their giftings to the next level. This 

book allows the believer to progress in their prophetic anointing until the prophetic ministry can become 

evident in their lives. This clear apostolic teaching allows a believer to know where they are in the prophetic 

anointing and helps them develop it to the next level.  

Catching the Waves of Revival (Dr. W. Ron Walker) *2nd Semester 

This apostolic teaching is a journey towards revival. It provides insights of the different stages of revival and 
how we can prepare ourselves to become involved with God and His purposes at every stage of divine activity 
in our quest for full-scale revival and city transformation. It reveals how whole churches can be prepared to be 
carriers of revival flames. This book allows the believer to chart the course of revival by discovering at what 



stage of revival they are in and work towards the next level. It provides strategies on how to consolidate each 
step of the way towards city transformation. This excellent work allows us to prepare systematically and plan 
strategically our corporate journey towards the full manifestation of the Holy Spirit's power on this earth for 
breakthroughs in the city, revival in the land and outpouring in the church. 

Culture of Honor (Rev. John S. Davis) 

In this powerful, revelation-packed book, Danny Silk describes the significant paradigm shift in church life, 

government, and relationships that has created and sustained the revival culture at Bethel Church in Redding, 

California. Through many relevant and true-life stories, the church is revealed as a place of freedom, respect, 

empowerment, and healthy discipline (not punishment). Culture of Honor challenges the status quo of church 

leadership structure and presents a refreshing view of the five-fold ministry. Jesus acknowledged this 

important principle in Matthew 20:25-26:But Jesus called them to Himself and said, 'You know that the rulers 

of the Gentiles lord it over them, and those who are great exercise authority over them. Yet it shall not be so 

among you; but whoever desires to become great among you, let him be your servant. If those with power 

learn how to empower those around them, then surely it will come to pass that, Thy kingdom come, Thy will 

be done on earth as it is in Heaven. You can apply-today-the truths revealed in this practical yet supernaturally 

charged set of principles to relationships in your family, workplace, community, ministry, church-wherever you 

deal with others. 

 

Second Year Courses: 

Spirit Life Training (Dr. Leroy Thompson, Jr.) 

Get your spirit ready for action! Do you have a desire to develop and release your true spiritual strength? Get 
fit and equipped with Spirit Life Training. Everything you need to be charged for supernatural change is in this 
practical manual! Spirit Life Training is a work-out program jammed full of proven-successful strategies to align 
your spirit, soul, and body to release the life and power that God put inside you. With exciting mind and body 
exercises designed to biblically align and strengthen your body, emotions, memory, intellect, imagination, and 
will, your recreated spirit-self will rise up and express the rejuvenated and refreshed life of abundance God 
intended for you. Everything you need to overcome in this life you have received in seed form at the point of 
salvation. Spirit Life Training is the process of discovering, strengthening, and releasing this treasure God has 
given you. 

Church Unusual (Dr. D.M. Thompson) 

Church Unusual lifts the perspectives and paradigms of pastors and Christian leaders to see the Church 
beyound its natural elements and environment. Church is the avenue and vehicle for the Kingdom of God 
manifesting here on earth as it is in heaven. This heavenly life, nature and atmosphere must be experienced 
within Church. This certain place will become an Awesom place. When that happens God can dwell in and 
manifest His power and glory through His Church to rule over all His enemies. The pledge the Father gave to 
His Begotten Son will become a total reality. Psalm 110:1-2 The LORD says to my lord: "Sit at My right hand 
Until I make Your enemies a footstool for Your feet." The LORD will stretch forth Your strong scepeter from 
Zion, saying, "Rule in the mist of Your enemies." 

 



Finishing Generation (Dr. Jeffrey Phillips) 

The Finishing Generation of breakthrough believers are rising across the horizon. There is a new breed without 

greed , a radical opposition to corruption emerging in every nation on the earth. This remnant of the holy seed 

have chosen to make a difference in the world, winning by righteousness. This book is written to prophesy 

their presence and help clarify their stature in the Spirit. This finishing generation will inspire the spirits of men 

as our hope of reaching the earth with the gospel of the kingdom is bound in them. Discover your part in this 

history making move of the Spirit. 

 

Spirit of Honor (Rev. Gregory Calhoun) 

We all have times in our lives when we stop and contemplate our walk with Christ and question whether or 

not we are living the blessed life God intended. Often we find dissatisfaction or unfulfilled destiny and wonder 

if something is missing in us or if God has forsaken us. In this exciting book, The Spirit of Honor, Bishop Tudor 

Bismark shows us that God is always faithful. However, people perish because of the lack of knowledge and 

many suffer because dishonour is present in their lives. This teaching by Bishop Bismark brings fresh revelation 

on the spirit of honor and invaluable information, key to our growth as believers. Learning about honor and 

the blessings connected with honor can be life changing.  

 

Prayer (Rev. JoAnn Thompson) *1st and 2nd Year Course 

Prayer is the Christian's lifeline to God, and with it lives are changed for eternity! Breathe life back into your 

prayer life. Learn how to go into deeper levels of prayer as you develop a close and intimate relationship with God. This 

book will help you to succeed in your ministry and in all facets of life. 

 

(Course descriptions are listed as described by the summary of the textbooks provided for each class. All 

Courses are subject to change without notice, at the discretion of the Apostle) 


